
 
 

Customized, Feasible, Premium Consulting  
  
  

Nirvana Consulting BV                                                                                                        www.nirvanaconsulting.be 
Excelsiorlaan 31, 1930 Zaventem                                                                                    info@nirvanaconsulting.be 
   

1 

 
 

DISCLAIMER 
 

 
The information provided by Nirvana Consulting BV  (“we,” “us” or “our”) on this 
website (the “Site”) is for general informational purposes only. While we use all 
reasonable efforts to include accurate and updated information and provide it in good 
faith, we make no representation or warranty of any kind, express or implied, 
regarding the accuracy, adequacy, validity, reliability, availability or completeness of 
any information on the Site. Under no circumstance shall we, and the related 
partnerships, the corporations, or we or the partners, agents or employees thereof, 
have any liability to you for any loss or damage of any kind incurred as a result of the 
use of the site or reliance on any information provided on the site. Your use of the site 
and your reliance on any information on the site is solely at your own risk.  
 
The information on this Site is provided with the understanding that the authors and 
publishers are not herein engaged in rendering legal, accounting, tax or other 
professional advice and services. As such, it should not be used as a substitute for 
professional advice. Accordingly, before taking any actions based upon such 
information, we encourage you to consult with the appropriate and competent 
professionals. 
 
The Site may contain (or you may be sent through the Site) links to other websites or 
content belonging to or originating from third parties or links to websites and features 
in banners or other advertising. Such external links are not investigated, monitored, or 
checked for accuracy, adequacy, validity, reliability, availability or completeness by us. 
We do not warrant, endorse, guarantee, or assume responsibility for the accuracy or 
reliability of any information offered by third-party websites linked through the site or 
any website or feature linked in any banner or other advertising. We will not be a party 
to or in any way be responsible for monitoring any transaction between you and third-
party providers of products or services. 
 
 


